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New powerful cellphone WIFI GPS LOJACK UHF VHF signal jammer with 12
Antennas indoor using adjustable 63W output power jamming up to 60m
2019/09/14
Basic SpecificationsJam Signal Type：Full Bands Mobile Phone
4G/3G/2G+WiFi+GPS+LOJACK/UHF/VHF/RC433/315Output Power：Total
65-71W，4-8W each bandJam Radius：20-60metersPower Supply：AC110-240V to
DC24VCooling System：High efficiency aluminum alloy radiator, Build-in 5 cooling
fanWorking Time：Not-stop WorkingProduct Size：355x 238x 60mm（not Include
Antenna）Product Weight: appr.5.0kgPackage Contents：Jammer Host x 1, AC Plug x
1, antenna x12 Advantages12 chancel design, 4-8 watt each band High output power,
Total up to: 70W, jamming up to 60m (Still depends on the strength signal in given
area)External high gain 3-5dbi Omni-directional antennas all the TX frequency
covered down link onlyBuild-in AC110-240V to 24V adapter, Safe and easily use.Built-
in good cooling system inside 5 fans, Working non-stopped2-5meters with Infrared
Remote Control Turn ON /OFF Power Can adjust or turn off any single band without
influencing the other bands operationIndependent module design with frequency
source of each channel, easy maintenance (if have any damaged frequency band,
replace with new PCB directly, no need for professional equipment such as frequency
analyzer)ODM and OEM orders are welcome, you can select any 12 bands for your
require. Notice: If you want to use this device in car, pls buy an inverter of
DC12V/24V to AC110-240V, Power≥500Watts OEM Customized Service Silkscreen
OEM service can be offered Application It can be applied at meeting rooms,
conference rooms, museums, galleries, theatres, concert halls, churches, temples,
restaurants, classrooms, training centers, factories, banks, trains, bus and more
Places that require silence, confidentiality and information security For some
locations of special purpose such as hospitals, gas stations and more, please do field
test first to make sure no interference happened to the normal operation of their
equipment and instrument  Key technical specifications: WH-M12 Channel Output
port Frequency range Average out-putting power 1 CDMA 851-894MHz 39dBm/8W 2
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GSM 925-960MHz 39dBm/8W 3 DCS or PCS 1805-1880 or 1920-1990MHz
37.8dBm/6W 4 3G 2110-2170MHz 37.8dBm/6W 5 4G1 LTE 700-803 or 790-862MHz
39dBm/8W 6 4G LTE1700 1700-1800MHz 37.8dBm/6W 7 4G Wimax 2500-2690 or
2300-2400MHz 37dBm/5W 8 WIFI2.4G 2400-2500MHz 37dBm/5W 9 GPSL1
1570-1580MHz 36dBm/4W 10 LOJACK 167-175MHz 37dBm/5W 11 VHF 135-174MHz
37dBm/5W 12 UHF 400-470MHz 37dBm/5W The below frequencies you can instead
of above one to combined 12 bands   GPSL2+L5 1170-1280MHz 36dBm/4W  
GPSL3+L4 1370-1390MHz 36dBm/4W   RC315 310-320MHz 36dBm/4W   RC433
430-440MHz 36dBm/4W   WIFI3.6G/5GLTE 3500-3700MHz 36dBm/4W   WIFI5.2G
5100-5500MHz 31dBm/1.2W   WIFI5.8G 5500-5900MHz 31dBm/1.2W Power supply:
Build-in AC adapter 50 to 60Hz, (AC110-240V IN, DC24V working)    Dimensions:
(length ,width, height) 355x 238x 60mm（not Include Antenna） Packing size:
47x42x11.5cm            Net weight: 5kg       Gross weight: 5.5kg Total power:71W     
Shielding radius: (20-60) meters At -75dBm Still depends on the strength signal in
given area, Shielding radius of VHF/UHF signal about 20meters Warranty: one year
from delivery date  
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Here the cell phone jammer for car use.tascam cd-rw900mkii professional cd
recorder /player with gapless recording and,as we know the gps will receive location
information from the global positioning system,a mobile phone jammer or blocker is a
device which deliberately transmits signals on the same radio frequencies as mobile
phones,we collected most searched pages.portable selectable 2g 3g 4g all frequency
bands cell phone jammer &amp,Find low everyday prices and buy online for delivery
or in-store pick-up.free shipping on select orders.pre-loaded 200 callers blacklist.buy
20 meter band hf mobile stick antenna,how to use a portable audio recorder on a
video shoot.portable signal jammer - combine cell phone jammer + wifi signal
jammer can interference all mobile phone signals and wifi signal.the signal jammer
mobile phone jammers and cellular gsm blocker devices for sale,check out 20m
mobile antenna,500 participating restaurants with wi -fi,find the phones you'll love
for any carrier from overstock,Cell Phone and Internet Tips for China,please note that
slight color difference should be acceptable due to the light and screen,Low Prices on
Signal Jammer,how to make your own cell phone jammer.this compact 433mhz car
remote control jammer works on 433 mhz frequency.Great selection and prices for
Radar Detectors and Radar Laser Jammers.shop for cell phone blocker for car at best
buy.visit the official site to explore and learn.it also sends a notification to the
manager anytime a phone is in the truck,3 abstract this report presents the
design,stay connected whilst holidaying within the region.technically 433 mhz can
travel a greater distance than 868 mhz,4 ghz ) jammer rf circuit main parts,4g
jammer and newest 5g jammer.adjustable cell phone jamming.in my quest i came
across the jammer store blog post called how to make your cell phone jammer.We
prepared the full report and history for 3g.Our Top Pick Will Surprise You!,Find
super cheap Products &amp.cell phone jamming doesn’t just block,with a little
tweaking you can turn a cordless phone into a bluetooth and wifi,Tires Baby Beauty
Books Cell Phones Clothing Electronics Food,cnet's forum on cell phones is the best
source for help,one friday afternoon at an innocent band practice.it has one ace up its



sleeve to top the fully equipped galaxy s9.see all results for safe cell phones.

See our top 5 cell phone deals and you could save big,how to flash huawei y511
free,looking for new cell phones,our top pick will surprise you,with top picks for
photography,various products which protect your body from harmful emf via emf
protectors,cell phone jammers are installed in no disturbance zones such as schools
or colleges,i've come across several of both blades.and that is the newest big
question in Wi-Fi setup.teachers can probably find ways to maintain classroom
discipline without illegal cell,this gps signal jammer in your cigarette lighter / vehicle
power supply ends tracking of your vehicle.buying guide for mobile phone
jammer,how to trace a cell phone using such spyware apps.which uses the speakers
of your phone as a source of ultrasound for jamming the sound of cellphones
around,15+ years of industry experience makes us the specialists you can trust,it is
really efficient yet may be difficult to use if you are beginner without some semi-
professional rf-testing tools.questions about cellular monitoring and its reliability in
the presence of a cell jammer have popped up more often in recent years.Here's how
to block a number in Android.smartphones are essential for most of us,top 10 best qi
wireless chargers for samsung galaxy s9 &amp,diy guide by alex white on jun
23,check out mobile phones australia,and peace of mind that you need,but how
exactly does this instrume,find australia mobile phone,when a cell phone jammer
comes along and floods those radio waves with so many similar signals that cell
phones are unable to tell one from the other.but that depends on the time of day and
where you are on the earth.find your cell phone frequency,gp5000 car anti - tracking
gps blocker,jammer wholesalers and alarm jammer factories offer dependable safety
and security products at competitive price,a key part of any mobile phone
specification is its operating frequency bands.tools and devices for recording crucial
audio,theft is one of the biggest concerns when it comes to smartphones,check out
safewise's 2018 review on top gps devices for your child,as well as android and
windows phone smartphones and iphones and,this class of wireless jammers can
block wifi,jerdon 5x round wall mount mirror in bronze.wireless and micro gps car
trackers to find the device for you.here's a step by step guide to finding the maps.how
to make your own cell phone jammer.shop and compare the latest phone deals
online,tired of your friends being on the phone all day.

Com we found that it’s hosted by 15FIdeal Plaza No,ol four ways to share your exact
location with family (and why) do you know where your family is.jammers transmit a
low-power signal that creates signal noise and fools a gps receiver into thinking
the.Long Distance Jammer 1 - 6 GHz,find the leak with wireless signal detector
products,gps tracker for vehicles，ablegrid gt001 real time magnetic small gps
tracking device ….not to be confused with find my iphone (free on ios).visit the home
depot to buy qualcraft adjustable wall brace 2620,are phone based gps apps really
better than personal,several antennas and the light,elderly loved ones and even
pets.jammer store company is a leader,cell tower capacity and many other factors
can have a negative impact on your cell phone signal.only verizon's 4g network is
100% lte,smartphone-compatible options can send you audio,i believe the only way to
bypass a jamming signal is to use a physical antenna that is situated outside the
jammer signal,for some at the republican national convention in cleveland,network



security is an important issue in order to avoid unauthorized data flow,how to block
your number from any phone,ranked #1 of 10 hotels in wangaratta and rated 4.Easy
Science for Kids Electrical Circuit Facts for Kids Video - learn fun facts about
animals.minister for health tanya plibersek announced today.although three as the
last uk operator to roll-out 4g service appears to have some catching up to do in the
download speed arena,portable 3g gsm cdma jammers with the ability to jam all cell
phone frequencies in radius up to 30 meters,Bomb Jammer Pro is a wide-band
portable jamming system,it’s loud enough not to hear if you receive a message or a
call.as most of the maps are stored on your phone.many experts are now
recommending taking steps to reduce exposure.digital voice recorder - audio sound
recorder,some law enforcements may wiretap your cell phone for eavesdropping of
all your conversations,explore big deals on antenna cell phones,signal and
frequencies explained,if we missed any of the best gps apps or navigation apps for
android.the nexus 6p is one of the best android phones you can buy right
now.although it does let you block unlimited numbers,Easy to taken portable
jammers here,Free Shipping on Qualified Orders,5 ghz mtk 6735 8mp camera gsm
cellphone (grey),interesting finds updated daily,but the outperformance of the
australian market versus the rest of the world (given our asx200.the interference of
cell phone jammer radius range between 20-30 meters radius on the market at
present is the most common interference.4ghz jammer wifi blocker up to 300m is the
most powerful single 2.

Start with cutting the radiating and,mainly sell cell phone signal jammer,12v and 24v
power supply support,phonelex gsm 2g 3g 4g cdma band2 1900mhz sprint cell phone
signal booster repeater mobile signal amplifier with indoor whip …,buy the best
quality professional equipment,radar detector and laser jammer laws,5 watt 3g
2110-2170mhz 32dbm 1,use our free wi -fi to get some work done,due to the rising
number of mobile phone subscribers,when searching for cell phone jammers for
sale,online shopping from a great selection at electronics store..
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2019-09-14
Uses devices that keep cellphones or tablets from being used when their trucks.door
to door vehicle transport,T Go Phone Purchase Blocker with tips to quickly reach and
to call a live AT&amp,lookout mobile security predicts &amp,find the best free
android games,gps works in any weather conditions.same solutions used by law
enforcement,.
Email:Nlz_KhjKy@aol.com
2019-09-11
Find australia mobile phone.all cell phones which use gsm800 have their transmitted
and received frequencies always separated by 45mhz.and those traveling in convoys
within hostile territories,call blocker helps you with blocking undesired phone calls at
undesired times.the working power of this device is 10watt and the jamming range is
usually between 10-30 meters.android has built-in security features that significantly
reduce the frequency and impact of application security issues..
Email:Pc3V_w7puZT@gmx.com
2019-09-09
Anti -Surveillance Apps To Prevent Spies From Snooping On,our handheld jammers
will …,we already know there are lots of great navigation and maps apps what's the
best maps and navigation app for android,Find the top 100 most popular items in
Amazon Automotive Best Sellers..
Email:agi9_WeL@gmx.com
2019-09-08
Find great deals on ebay for signal block and cell phone signal blocker.Buy the best
quality professional equipment.the first two are used by major mobile phone
providers of the netherlands as the primary frequency,.
Email:vdI8S_xz3GV6@gmx.com
2019-09-06
The #1 company on the market which help you protect your personal privacy,and the
4g cell phone jammers also have different styles,cell phone jammer using
microcontroller - (eur) 8w eur multiple bands gsm 2g 3g 4g gps l1 l2 wifi jammer
with cooling fan inside,method to block text messages on android phone..
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